
Bid Number: 24-36

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Univar Solutions USA Inc Trenton Ohio 575 DRY TONS $492.00 $282,900.00

1a Alternate 4 - Polyaluminum 

Chlorida:   4,300 gal. Load min.                    
1,440,000 WET LB No Bid No Bid

Total Group A: $282,900.00

Group B -

Liquid Chlorine:

140 TONS No Bid

12 EA No Bid

Total Group B: No Bid

250 TONS $525.00 $131,250.00

Total Group C: $131,250.00

25 TONS No Bid

Total Group D: No Bid

25,000 GAL No Bid

Total Group E: No Bid

Alternate 1 - 90/10 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 2 - 70/30 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 3 - 85/15 Blended Phosphate 

(orth/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid
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Group D - Liquid

Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid Cationic

Polymer - 4,300 gal.

Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 60/40 -            

Blended Phosphate -

4,000 gal. Load min.

Group B -2 - Liquid Chlorine -

2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150

lb. Cylinder

Group C - Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - Liquid 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 4,300 gal. Load min.

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, October 15, 2024 Demandstar E-bidding

Description

Group A - Liquid Alum. Sulfate:

1 - Alumina Trihydrate -

4,300 gal. Load min.



Bid Number:

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Carus Corp Peru, IL 575 DRY TONS No Bid

1a Alternate 4 - Polyaluminum 

Chlorida:   4,300 gal. Load min.                    
1,440,000 WET LB No Bid

Total Group A: No Bid

Group B -

Liquid Chlorine:

140 TONS No Bid

12 EA No Bid

Total Group B: No Bid

250 TONS No Bid

Total Group C: No Bid

25 TONS No Bid

Total Group D: No Bid

25,000 GAL  $                 10.976 $274,400.00

Total Group E: $274,400.00

Alternate 1 - 90/10 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL  $                 10.856 271,400.000$                                

Alternate 2 - 70/30 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL  $                 10.944 273,600.000$                                

Alternate 3 - 85/15 Blended Phosphate 

(orth/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL  $                 10.509 262,725.000$                                
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Group C - Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - Liquid 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid

Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid Cationic

Polymer - 4,300 gal.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 6 - Blended 

Phosphate -

4,000 gal. Load min.

Group A - Liquid Alum. Sulfate:

1 - Alumina Trihydrate -

4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -2 - Liquid Chlorine -

2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 83 - Liquid Chlorine - 150

lb. Cylinder

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, October 15, 2024, Demandstar E-bidding

Description



Bid Number: 

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Chemtrade Parsippany, NJ 575 DRY TONS $645.00 $370,875.00

1a Alternate 4 - Polyaluminum 

Chlorida:   4,300 gal. Load min.                    1,440,000 WET LB $0.26 $374,400.00

Total Group A: $745,275.00
Group B -

Liquid Chlorine:

140 TONS No Bid

12 EA No Bid

Total Group B: No Bid

250 TONS No Bid

Total Group C: No Bid

25 TONS No Bid

Total Group D: No Bid

25,000 GAL No Bid

Total Group E: No Bid

Alternate 1 - 90/10 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 2 - 70/30 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 3 - 85/15 Blended Phosphate 

(orth/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid
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Group C - Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - Liquid 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid

Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid Cationic

Polymer - 4,300 gal.

Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 6 - Blended 

Phosphate -

4,000 gal. Load min.

Description

Group A - Liquid Alum. Sulfate:

1 - Alumina Trihydrate -

4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -2 - Liquid Chlorine -

2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150

lb. Cylinder

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, October 15, 2024, Demandstar E-bidding



Bid Number:

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Alexander Chemical LaPorte, IN 575 DRY TONS $401.25 $230,178.75

1a Alternate 4 - Polyaluminum 

Chlorida:   4,300 gal. Load min.                    1,440,000 WET LB No Bid

Total Group A: $230,178.75
Group B -

Liquid Chlorine:

140 TONS $1,829.00 $256,060.00

12 EA $175.00 $2,100.00

Total Group B: . $258,160.00

250 TONS $516.00 $129,000.00

Total Group C: $129,000.00

25 TONS No Bid

Total Group D: No Bid

25,000 GAL No Bid

Total Group E:

Alternate 1 - 90/10 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 2 - 70/30 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 3 - 85/15 Blended Phosphate 

(orth/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid
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Group E -Blended Phosphate: 6 - Blended 

Phosphate -

4,000 gal. Load min.

Group C - Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - Liquid 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid

Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid Cationic

Polymer - 4,300 gal.

2 - Liquid Chlorine -

2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150

lb. Cylinder

Group A - Liquid Alum. Sulfate:

1 - Alumina Trihydrate -

4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, October 15, 2024, Demandstar E-bidding

Description

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals



Bid Number:

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Polydyne Inc. Riceboro, GA 575 DRY TONS No Bid

1a Alternate 4 - Polyaluminum 

Chlorida:   4,300 gal. Load min.                    
1,440,000 WET LB No Bid

Total Group A: No Bid
Group B -

Liquid Chlorine:

140 TONS No Bid

12 EA No Bid

Total Group B: No Bid

250 TONS No Bid

Total Group C: No Bid

25 TONS $1,680.00 $42,000.00

Total Group D: $42,000.00

25,000 GAL No Bid

Total Group E:

Alternate 1 - 90/10 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 2 - 70/30 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 3 - 85/15 Blended Phosphate 

(orth/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid
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Group E -Blended Phosphate: 6 - Blended 

Phosphate -

4,000 gal. Load min.

Group C - Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - Liquid 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid

Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid Cationic

Polymer - 4,300 gal.

Load min.

2 - Liquid Chlorine -

2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 83 - Liquid Chlorine - 150

lb. Cylinder

Group A - Liquid Alum. Sulfate:

1 - Alumina Trihydrate -

4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, October 15, 2024, Demandstar E-bidding

Description

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals



Bid Number: 

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Shannon Chemical Corp Malvern, PA 575 DRY TONS No Bid

1a Alternate 4 - Polyaluminum 

Chlorida:   4,300 gal. Load min.                    
1,440,000 WET LB No Bid

Total Group A: No Bid

Group B -

Liquid Chlorine:

140 TONS No Bid

12 EA No Bid

Total Group B: No Bid

250 TONS No Bid

Total Group C: No Bid

25 TONS No Bid

Total Group D: No Bid

25,000 GAL  $8.91/g 222,750.000$                                

Total Group E: 222,750.000$                                

Alternate 1 - 90/10 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL  $8.91/g 222,750.000$                                

Alternate 2 - 70/30 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL  $8.91/g 222,750.000$                                

Alternate 3 - 85/15 Blended Phosphate 

(orth/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL  $8.91/g 222,750.000$                                
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Group E -Blended Phosphate: 6 - Blended 

Phosphate -

4,000 gal. Load min.

Group C - Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - Liquid 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid

Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid Cationic

Polymer - 4,300 gal.

2 - Liquid Chlorine -

2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150

lb. Cylinder

Group A - Liquid Alum. Sulfate:

1 - Alumina Trihydrate -

4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, October 15, 2024, Demandstar E-bidding

Description

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals



Bid Number: 23-50

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

USALCO, LLC. Baltimore, MD 575 DRY TONS $375.45 $215,885.88

1a Alternate 4 - Polyaluminum 

Chlorida:   4,300 gal. Load min.                    1,440,000 WET LB $0.28 $403,200.00

Total Group A: $619,085.88
Group B -

Liquid Chlorine:

140 TONS No Bid

12 EA No Bid

Total Group B: No Bid

250 TONS No Bid

Total Group C: No Bid

25 TONS No Bid

Total Group D: No Bid

25,000 GAL No Bid

Total Group E:

Alternate 1 - 90/10 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 2 - 70/30 Blended Phosphate 

(ortho/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid

Alternate 3 - 85/15 Blended Phosphate 

(orth/poly)-4,000 gal. Load min 25000 GAL No Bid No Bid

Page

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 6 - Blended 

Phosphate -

4,000 gal. Load min.

Group C - Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - Liquid 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid

Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid Cationic

Polymer - 4,300 gal.

Load min.

2 - Liquid Chlorine -

2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 83 - Liquid Chlorine - 150

lb. Cylinder

Group A - Liquid Alum. Sulfate:

1 - Alumina Trihydrate -

4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, October 15, 2024, Demandstar E-bidding

Description

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Linda Thomas
Typewriter
7


