
Bid Number: 22-54

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Alexander Chemical Corp Laporte, IN 624 DRY TONS $372.00 $232,128.00
Total Group A: $232,128.00

160 TONS $1,989.00 $318,240.00

20 EA $198.00 $3,960.00
Total Group B: $322,200.00

375 TONS $482.00 $180,750.00
Total Group C: $180,750.00

58 TONS No Bid
Total Group D:

351,000 POUNDS No Bid
Total Group E:

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, September 20, 2022, Demandstar E-bidding

Description

Group A - Liquid Alum. 
Sulfate:
1 - Alumina Trihydrate -
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -
Liquid Chlorine:

2 - Liquid Chlorine -
2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150
lb. Cylinder

Group C - Liquid 
Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - 
Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid
Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid 
Cationic
Polymer - 4,300 gal.
Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 
6 - Blended Phosphate -
45,000 lbs Load min.
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Bid Number: 22-54

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Carus Corp Peru, IL 624 DRY TONS No Bid
Total Group A:

160 TONS
No Bid

20 EA
No Bid

Total Group B:

375 TONS No Bid
Total Group C:

58 TONS No Bid
Total Group D:

351,000 POUNDS $1.08 $379,080.00
Total Group E: $379,080.00

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, September 20, 2022, Demandstar E-bidding

Description
Group A - Liquid Alum. 
Sulfate:
1 - Alumina Trihydrate -
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -
Liquid Chlorine:

2 - Liquid Chlorine -
2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150
lb. Cylinder

Group C - Liquid 
Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - 
Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid
Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid 
Cationic
Polymer - 4,300 gal.
Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 
6 - Blended Phosphate -
45,000 lbs Load min.
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Bid Number: 22-54

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Chemtrade Parsippany, NJ 624 DRY TONS $610.00 $380,640.00
Total Group A: $380,640.00

160 TONS No Bid

20 EA No Bid
Total Group B:

375 TONS No Bid
Total Group C:

58 TONS No Bid
Total Group D:

351,000 POUNDS No Bid
Total Group E:

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, September 20, 2022, Demandstar E-bidding

Description

Group A - Liquid Alum. 
Sulfate:
1 - Alumina Trihydrate -
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -
Liquid Chlorine:

2 - Liquid Chlorine -
2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150
lb. Cylinder

Group C - Liquid 
Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - 
Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid
Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid 
Cationic
Polymer - 4,300 gal.
Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 
6 - Blended Phosphate -
45,000 lbs Load min.
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Bid Number: 22-54

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Pencco Inc. San Felipe, TX 624 DRY TONS No Bid
Total Group A:

160 TONS

No Bid

20 EA No Bid
Total Group B:

375 TONS $630.00 $236,250.00
Total Group C: $236,250.00

58 TONS No Bid
Total Group D:

351,000 POUNDS No Bid
Total Group E:

Description
Group A - Liquid Alum. 
Sulfate:
1 - Alumina Trihydrate -
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -
Liquid Chlorine:

2 - Liquid Chlorine -
2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150
lb. Cylinder

Group C - Liquid 
Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - 
Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid
Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid 
Cationic
Polymer - 4,300 gal.
Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 
6 - Blended Phosphate -
45,000 lbs Load min.

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, September 20, 2022, Demandstar E-bidding
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Bid Number: 22-54

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Polydyne Inc. Riceboro, GA 624 DRY TONS No Bid
Total Group A:

160 TONS
No Bid

20 EA No Bid
Total Group B:

375 TONS No Bid
Total Group C:

58 TONS $1,580.00 $91,640.00
Total Group D: $91,640.00

351,000 POUNDS No Bid
Total Group E:

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, September 20, 2022, Demandstar E-bidding

Description

Group A - Liquid Alum. 
Sulfate:
1 - Alumina Trihydrate -
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -
Liquid Chlorine:

2 - Liquid Chlorine -
2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150
lb. Cylinder

Group C - Liquid 
Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - 
Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid
Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid 
Cationic
Polymer - 4,300 gal.
Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 
6 - Blended Phosphate -
45,000 lbs Load min.
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Bid Number: 22-54

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Shannon Chemical Corp Malvern, PA 624 DRY TONS No Bid
Total Group A:

160 TONS No Bid

20 EA No Bid
Total Group B:

375 TONS No Bid
Total Group C:

58 TONS No Bid
Total Group D:

351,000 POUNDS $1.16 $408,564.00
Total Group E: $408,564.00

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, September 20, 2022, Demandstar E-bidding

Description

Group A - Liquid Alum. 
Sulfate:
1 - Alumina Trihydrate -
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -
Liquid Chlorine:

2 - Liquid Chlorine -
2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150
lb. Cylinder

Group C - Liquid 
Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - 
Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid
Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid 
Cationic
Polymer - 4,300 gal.
Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 
6 - Blended Phosphate -
45,000 lbs Load min.
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Bid Number: 22-54

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Univar USA Inc. Fairfield 624 DRY TONS $497.87 $310,670.88
Total Group A: $310,670.88

160 TONS No Bid

20 EA No Bid
Total Group B:

375 TONS $589.00 $220,875.00
Total Group C: $220,875.00

58 TONS No Bid
Total Group D:

351,000 POUNDS No Bid
Total Group E:

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, September 20, 2022, Demandstar E-bidding

Description

Group A - Liquid Alum. 
Sulfate:
1 - Alumina Trihydrate -
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -
Liquid Chlorine:

2 - Liquid Chlorine -
2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150
lb. Cylinder

Group C - Liquid 
Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - 
Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group D - Liquid
Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid 
Cationic
Polymer - 4,300 gal.
Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 
6 - Blended Phosphate -
45,000 lbs Load min.
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Bid Number: 22-54

Company Name City/State Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

USALCO, LLC. Baltimore, MD 624 DRY TONS $443.21 $276,563.04
Total Group A: $276,563.04

160 TONS No Bid

20 EA No Bid
Total Group B:

375 TONS No Bid
Total Group C:

58 TONS No Bid
Total Group D:

351,000 POUNDS No Bid
Total Group E:

CITY OF EVANSTON

Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, September 20, 2022, Demandstar E-bidding

Description
Group A - Liquid Alum. 
Sulfate:
1 - Alumina Trihydrate -
4,300 gal. Load min.

Group B -
Liquid Chlorine:

2 - Liquid Chlorine -
2,000 lb Cylinders, Lots of 8

3 - Liquid Chlorine - 150
lb. Cylinder

Group C - Liquid 
Hydrofluosilicic Acid: 4 - 
Liquid Hydrofluosilicic Acid - 
4,300 gal. Load min.
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Group D - Liquid
Cationic Polymer: 5 - Liquid 
Cationic
Polymer - 4,300 gal.
Load min.

Group E -Blended Phosphate: 
6 - Blended Phosphate -
45,000 lbs Load min.


